
From: 

To: 

Cc: 

Hi Tina, 

Re: CAA-08-2012-0003 and 0004 
Greg Bazley to: Tina Artemis 
Cc: Cobb.David 

Greg Bazley/R8/USEPAIUS 

Tina Artemis/RSJUSEPAlUS@EPA 

Cobb.David@epa.gov 

I have received the reports (certification of compliance). We can close these two out. Thank you, 

Greg Sazley 
US EPA Region 8 
1 595 Wynkoop Street 
Denver, CO 80202-1129 
Phone: 303.312.6255 
Fax: 303.3 12.6409 

Tina Artemis Pi1YI11CIlI h,-lS been I()ccived H\ full PllJLlSe let 111 

From: Tina Allemis/RBIUSEPAiUS 

OSI18f2012 08:00:54 AM 

To: 
Date: 

Greg BazleyfR8/USEPAlUS@EPA, David Schachterle/RB/USEPAlUS@EPA 
05/181201208:00 AM 

Subject: CAA-08-2012-0003 and 0004 

Payment has been received in full. Please let me know when this will close after the reports are received 
and approved by EPA. 

Thank you 

Paralegal/Regional Hearing Clerk 
U.S. EPA - Region 8 
1595 Wynkoop Street 
Denver, CO 80202-1129 
303-312-6765 - Telephone 
303-312-6859 - Fax 


